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SAN JOSE, Calif. & HYDERABAD, India--(BUSINESS WIRE)-- Analytics Insight has announced 'The 10 Most Influential Women in Technology
2020' in its November magazine issue. This is the seventh volume that focuses on women leaders driving substantial innovation across their
organizations.

This magazine issue recognizes the achievements of ten dynamic women who are breaking barriers and setting high standards for themselves and
others in the tech industry. Here are the executives that made the list.

Featuring as the Cover Story is Laetitia Cailleteau, Global Lead of Conversational AI for Accenture. She is also Accenture Technology's lead for
Data & AI in Europe – driving innovation, sales, and delivery for multiple industries and clients. She founded the Liquid Studio in London, an applied
innovation lab, where her team offers flagship capabilities within AI and cognitive processes. She is also a reserve member of the Artificial
Intelligence High-Level Group at the European Commission.

This issue features Donna Fenn, Paula P. Carneiro and Stefanie Lindstaedt as Executives of the Month.

Donna Fenn: Donna Fenn is the Vice President, Human Resources of pSemi Corporation. She serves as the head of human resources for over
600 employees globally. At pSemi, Donna's vision from day one has been to deliver best in class HR services and programs through the adoption of
new technology platforms and applications.

Paula P. Carneiro: Paula joined as the Director of Business Development and Partner Relations of WonderBotz in January 2020 to shift her focus
to automation after an extensive operational career in process improvement. Her primary focus at WonderBotz is to create new business channels
and help evangelize Intelligent Automation technologies as far and wide as she can.

Stefanie Lindstaedt: Stefanie is the CEO of Know-Center and the Director of Institute of Interactive Systems & Data Science (ISDS). Under her
leadership, Know-Center has developed into one of the leading European research centers for data-driven business and AI supporting European
companies of all sizes and sectors to turn data into value.

April Downing: April is the Co-founder and COO of Supply Drop, the first replenishment commerce platform that is changing the way consumers
are getting their everyday essentials, via leveraging machine learning, AI and conversational intelligence.

Ghalia BERRADA LAMINE: Ghalia is the General Country Manager at Dokeos, a Paris-based digital learning company. She has a demonstrated
history of 12 years of professional experience in Marketing, Management and Computer Science, mainly Business Intelligence.

Jaya Vaidhyanathan: Jaya is the CEO of BCT Digital, managing the end-to-end business operations and expansions, P&L, product innovation and
ensuring market success. Jaya also serves on global boards such as UTI AMC and Mastermind Foundation (NGO).

Madhumita Mund Rao: Madhumita is a globally recognized data and technology leader with over 20 years of experience. She is the Co-founder of
Pukka Analytics (MLCloudStudio) and Chief Innovation Officer of DataPitcher.com, an AI-based Data Monetization platform.

Priyanka Mehandiratta: Priyanka is the Director of Leadership Development at DX Learning Canada. She has a deep expertise in developing
leaders at all levels to be more human and better at things robots can't replace-interpersonal.

Susan Joynt: Susan is the Founder and CEO of RuListing. Over Susan’s career, her entrepreneurial ambitions centered on real estate as an
Investor, Founder of Renovation Management Consulting, and published author of: “The Wise Renovator.”

There has been a fundamental shift in the leadership roles in this rapidly transforming tech industry. Analytics Insight aims to recognize innovators,
pioneers and visionaries who are driving momentum in this field with their achievements. These women have demonstrated considerable expertise
in the field of technology with leadership that is constantly evolving and helping reach new milestones across this industry while delivering
revolutionary value and setting a benchmark for the rest.

Read their detailed coverage here. For more information, please visit https://www.analyticsinsight.net/.

About Analytics Insight®

Analytics Insight is an influential platform dedicated to insights, trends, and opinions from the world of data-driven technologies. It monitors
developments, recognition, and achievements made by AI, big data and analytics companies across the globe. The Analytics Insight Magazine
features opinions and views from top leaders and executives in the industry who share their journey, experiences, success stories, and knowledge
to grow profitable businesses.
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